


174 May 26th 1794 - 568 . 30 Amount brot over For Materials for Highways Drains & 
thirty pounds to make good what may be abated , as worked out on the Highway thirty 
pounds -- 30 . To pay Treasurer & Collectors Comission fifty pounds 50.0 . 0 For 
contingencies ten pounds 10. 00 For Stroudwater & Prides Bridges , twelve pounds 12 , 
A. to buy powder & ball & Seventy pounds - To pay accounts allowed by the town two 
hun = 70.0 . 0 dred & ten pounds , seventeen shillings & four pence #¬ 210, 174 1874 that 
the vote for raising the sum of one hundred & ninetysee page 169 = ven pounds , eight 
shillings , four pence to pay accounts be reconsidered , & that the sum of two hundred 
& ten pounds & Seventeen shillings be raised to pay accounts voted & allowed by the 
town Coled That the bills be given to the Collectors of Highway taxes by the tenth of 
June next , Voted that the Surveyors of Highways with Voted out their bills by the last of 
August nextthat Mr Epes be excused from serving on the School com mittee , & Mr 
Waite , Doct Harding , Mr Thrasher , Mr Isley Voted Mr Boyd & Mr Symmes That there 
eight more , added to the School Comittee , Voted Capt Hobby , Thos Motley , 
Ebenezer Maye , Arthur M Lellan , Mr Deane Doe Erving , , James Fosdick & Ebenezer 
Storer , bead = ded -- Several others were chosen & excused , see the minutes ) Article 
16th On motion that this article be dismissed it passed in the ne gative -- Voted that the 
town will choose five Delegates to meet in convention at Portland on the third 
Wednesday in June next , to take into consideration the expediency of erecting the 
three Counties of York , Cumberland and in on into a separate government , Thos 
Motley , Salmon Chase , Colo James Lunt , William Symnes , & Mr John Bagley , be 
Deg Delegates -- Several others were chosen excused for which see the minutes , 
Recorded by John Frothingham Town Clerk Coled Voted At a Meeting of the Inhabitants 
of the town of Portland June 18th 1794 for the purpose of electing three Grand Jurors , 
& four Petit Jurors for the Supreme Court : Sam Freeman was chosen Moderator , 
Daniel Exes , William McLellan , & Stephen Waite were chosen Grand Jurors , Edward 
Oxnard , Richard Codman , Robt Boyd , & Thomas Cumming were drawn as Petit 
Jurors -- Recorded by John Frothingham Town Clerk --- To M William Hobby one of the 
Constables of the Town of Portland Greeting You are hereby required in the name of 
the Commonwealth Massachusetts to notify and warn the Inhabitants of the said Town 
land to assemble at the Court house in said Town on Tuesday July 8th 1794 next at ten 
o'Clock in the forenoon , to see what the town will do in regard to repairing Prides 
Bridge -- Given under our hands this fifth day of July AD 1794 , Sam Freeman #¬ 
Selectmen Pursuant to the within warrant I duly the Inhabitants of the town of Portland , 
to assemble at the time & place , and for the purpose within mentioned Portland July 8 
194 William Hobby , Constable a Legal Meeting of the Inhabitants of the Town of 
Portland on Tues day the 8th day of July 1794 , Samuel Freeman chosen Moderator 
That this meeting , be adjourned to Monday next at six o'clock PM Recorded by John 
Frothingham Town Clerk 175 To William Hobby one of the Constables of the Town of 
Portland Greeting you are hereby required in the name of the Commonwealth of Massa 
chusetts to notify and warn the Inhabitants of said town qualified by Law to vote in Town 
Meetings , to assemble at the Court house in said town on Monday next at six o'clock in 
the afternoon to see if the Town will repair Predes Bridge . And if so , to vote so much 
money as may as may be judged necessary for that pur = pose . And to act hereon as 
they shall judge et Sam Freeman , Nath F Fosdick #¬ Woodbury Stover Selectmen 
Pursuant to the within warrant I duly notified the Inhabitants the Town of Portland 
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qualified to vote in Town Meetings to assen ble at the Court house in said town at six 
o'clock this afternoon for the purpose within mentioned Portland July 11th 94 William 
Hobby Constable the Legal Meeting of the Inhabitants of the town of Portland on 
Monday July 14th 1794 , Deacon Titcomb was chosen Moderator Voted that the Town 
will repair Prides Bridge That the sum of thirty six pounds , be raised for the purpose of 
repairing Frides Bridge - That Major Isley be a Comittee to agree with some persons to 
repair Prides Bridge - - - Recorded by John Frothingham Town Clerk To Mr William 
Hobby one of the Constables of the town of Portland Greeting you are hereby required 
in the name of the Commonwealth of Mass chusetts to notify & warn the Inhabitants of 
the said town of Portland qualified by Law to vote in Town Meetings to meet at the 
Courthouse in said town at three o'clock in the afternoon of this day -- To see if the 
town will purchase any land whereon to erect pertifications for the defence of the town 
and harbour , and if so wraye as much me ney as may be judged necessary for that 
purpose - Dated July 15th 1794 - Sam Freeman Nath F Fosdick Woodbury Slovers
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